

Unknown

From: Neelmc@aol.com
Sent: 11/07/2009 6:47 AM
To: TCapella; JYoung; CRoberts; ELagasse; BLee; cleesheng@jeffparish.net
Subject: Fwd: JEFF OFFICIALS GOT CUT IN DEAL
Attachments: JEFF OFFICIALS GOT CUT IN DEAL (9.26 KB)

To All Member of the Jefferson Parish Council:

Based on the information contained in this forwarded E-mail, you should take appropriate action to terminate this insurance contract immediately. Is there a need to investigate such sham, ethics violations, and contract violations? I think not! Let's get serious about open and honest government at the local level!

Respectfully submitted,

Ted C. Mc Neel Sr.
Major USMC Retired
6301 Schouest Street
Metairie, LA 70003-2906
504-715-8412
neelmc@aol.com

Unknown

From: Neelmc@aol.com
Sent: 11/04/2009 11:10 AM
To: LCongemi
Subject: Fwd: JEFF OFFICIALS GOT CUT IN DEAL

Attachments: ATT33004.eml (7.46 KB)

I believe this is a matter that the Jefferson Parish Council should investigate and take appropriate action for B&A's Contract for insurance with West Jefferson General Hospital to be terminated for cause, i.e., ethics violations.

Ted C. Mc Neel Sr.
Major USMC Retired
6301 Schouest Street
Metairie, LA 70003-2906
504-715-8412
neelmc@aol.com

Unknown**Sent:** 11/07/2009 8:11 AM

Return-path: <Neelmc@aol.com>

From: Neelmc@aol.com

Full-name: Neelmc

Message-ID: <cf1.62b1fce4.38204694@aol.com>

Date: Mon, 2 Nov 2009 09:28:36 EST

Subject: JEFF OFFICIALS GOT CUT IN DEAL

To: jdeberry@timespicayune.com, sgrace@timespicayune.com

MIME-Version: 1.0

Content-Type: multipart/alternative; boundary="-----1257172116"

X-Mailer: 9.0 for Windows sub 5132

-----1257172116

Content-Type: text/plain; charset="US-ASCII"

Content-Transfer-Encoding: 7bit

Maybe this investigative reporting is in Stephanie Grace's jurisdiction. I hope one of you thoroughly checks out the sweet deal that former Jefferson Parish President Tim Coulon and current Broussard Administrative Assistant Tim Whitmer got in the insurance contract at West Jefferson Medical Center. If this is not a sham and ethics violation - what is? Why are their hidden benefactors in a Wally Pontiff Sr. brokered contract for B&A Insurance Agency of Metairie, LA. This is so rotten it stinks and is old politics rearing its ugly head again. Just when you thought that Tim Coulon was on the up and up he surreptitiously becomes an Independent Insurance Broker partnering with Lagniappe who also never appears as part of the contract negotiated by B&A's Wally Pontiff Sr. How can it be possible for a Jefferson Parish Employee's side Insurance Business profit from a Jefferson Parish regulated entity! The whole affair makes me disgusted with the Parish Government - Both the Council who approved this suspicious deal and Boussard's Administration. I will admit I do not care for Broussard after the lousy decisions he made during "Katrina."

Respectfully,

Ted C. Mc Neel Sr.
Major USMC Retired
6301 Schouest Street
Metairie, LA 7003-2906
504-715-8412

I am informing my Councilman Nick Congemi of the above comments!

-----1257172116

Content-Type: text/html; charset="US-ASCII"

Content-Transfer-Encoding: quoted-printable

<HTML><HEAD>

<META content=3D"text/html; charset=3DUS-ASCII" charset=3DUS-ASCII http-equiv=3DContent-Type>

<META name=3DGENERATOR content=3D"MSHTML 8.00.6001.18828"></HEAD>

<BODY style=3D"BACKGROUND-COLOR: #ffffff; FONT-FAMILY: Arial; FONT-SIZE:=10pt">

<DIV>Maybe this investigative reporting is in Stephanie Grace's jurisdiction. I hope one of you thoroughly checks out the sweet deal that former Jefferson Parish President Tim Coulon and current Broussard Administrative Assistant Tim Whitmer got in the insurance contract at West Jefferson=

Medical Center. If this is not a sham and ethics violation - what is? Why are their hidden benefactors in a Wally Pontiff Sr. brokered contract for B&A Insurance Agency of Metairie, LA. This is so rotten it stinks and is old politics rearing its ugly head again. Just when you thought that Tim Coulon was on the up and up he surreptitiously becomes an Independent Insurance Broker partnering with Lagniappe who also never appears as part of the contract negotiated by B&A's Wally Pontiff Sr. How can it be possible for a Jefferson Parish Employee's side Insurance Business profit from a Jefferson Parish regulated entity! The whole affair makes me disgusted with the Parish Government - Both the Council who approved this suspicious deal and Boussard's Administration. I will admit I do not care for Broussard after the lousy decisions he made during "Katrina."

Respectfully,

Ted C. Mc Neel Sr.

Major USMC Retired

6301 Schouest Street

Metairie, LA 7003-2906

504-715-8412

I am informing my Councilman Nick Congemi of the above comments!

-----1257172116--

Unknown

From: LGruntz [LGruntz@jeffparish.net]
Sent: 12/09/2009 3:02 PM
To: TCapella; JYoung; CRoberts; BLee; EltonLagasse; ELagasse; LCongemi; CynthiaLeesheng; ABroussard
Cc: BSmith; AVandenweghe
Subject: FW: Lee Zurik Public Records Request
Attachments: connick&connick2.doc

Please be advised that Lee Zurik has made a public record request for information regarding the Parish's legal services contract with Connick & Connick.
 We are in the process of accumulating the information.
 If you have any questions, please call.

Louis G. Gruntz, Jr.

Deputy Parish Attorney
 1221 Elmwood Park Blvd.
 Suite 701
 Jefferson, LA 70123
 Tel. (504) 736-6300

Confidentiality/Privileged

The contents of this electronic message may constitute privileged communications between an attorney and his client, the Parish of Jefferson, that may be protected by the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C. §§ 2510, et seq., and may otherwise be protected as the work-product of counsel, which is intended for the exclusive benefit of the client and for which any applicable privilege is expressly retained. If you or your employer are not the intended recipient of this message or an employee or agent responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient, or otherwise have received this message erroneously, you are specifically requested to immediately advise the Jefferson Parish Attorney's Office of its receipt, either via electronic message or by telephone, at the address and/or one of the numbers delineated above., you are additionally expressly instructed, without further delay, to delete from your computer and network, if applicable, the contents of this message, together with any attachments appended thereto, and to wholly refrain from duplicating, printing, storing, or otherwise disseminating to any individual the information contained therein and that any unauthorized dissemination or copying is strictly prohibited.

Consistent with 31 C.F.R. 10.35(b)(4) promulgated by the United States Department of the Treasury, the Parish Attorney's Office is required to include the following statement in this message: "Any advice contained herein or in any Attachment appended thereto, regarding federal tax matters, was not intended or written by the sender to be used, and it cannot be used, by any taxpayer for the purpose of avoiding penalties that may be imposed on the taxpayer or to market, promote, or recommend to another party any matter or transaction addressed herein."

From: AVandenweghe
Sent: Tuesday, December 08, 2009 5:17 PM
To: WFortenberry
Cc: KFrissard; LGruntz
Subject: FW: Lee Zurik Public Records Request

Please prepare a response, a Certification and scan to me.
 If this response will exceed 20 pages or include over-sized documents please advise PRIOR to scanning or collecting so I can confirm payment from the Requester.

If you do not have any Public Records which are responsive please execute a Certification stating "NO RECORDS FOUND".

Thank you,

Anne Marie Vandenweghe, Esq.
 Parish Attorney's Office
 1221 Elmwood Park Boulevard, Suite 310

Jefferson , La. 70123
Direct line: 504-731-4505
Fax: 504-731-4517

ATTORNEY-CLIENT PRIVILEGED

CONFIDENTIALITY MESSAGE

Privileged:

This e-mail contains PRIVILEGED and CONFIDENTIAL information intended only for the use of the specific individual or entity named above. If you or your employer is not the intended recipient of this e-mail or an employee or agent responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any unauthorized dissemination or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you have received this transmission in error, please immediately delete the message.

Circular 230:

Pursuant to federal tax regulations imposed on practitioners who render tax advice ("Circular 230"), we are required to advise you that any advice contained in this communication regarding federal taxes is not written or intended to be used, and cannot be used, by any person as the basis for avoiding federal tax penalties under the Internal Revenue Code, nor can such advice be used or referred to for the purpose of promoting, marketing or recommending any entity, investment, plan or arrangement.

From: Zurik, Lee [mailto:LZurik@fox8tv.net]
Sent: Monday, December 07, 2009 12:32 PM
To: PublicRecordsRequest
Cc: AVandenweghe
Subject: Lee Zurik Public Records Request

Please see attached.

Thanks,

Lee

Lee Zurik
Anchor/Chief Investigative Reporter
WVUE-TV
1025 S. Jefferson Davis Pkwy.
New Orleans, LA 70125
W - 504-483-1544
Email: lzurik@fox8tv.net

www.facebook.com/leezurik
www.twitter.com/leezurik

Unknown

From: Tim Coulon [TPCoulon@TPCoulon.hostpilot.com]

Sent: 09/03/2009 4:30 PM

To: TCapella; JYoung; Bordelon; TAWhitmer

Cc: tpcoulon@cox.net

Subject: Zephyrs

After todays meeting with Zephyrs Management I believe the LSED has successfully negotiated a new 5 year contract with the NO Zephyrs.

The contract will include a provision that provides 450,000 annually for certain documented expenses and continuing capital, and gives up the developmental rights of the adjoining 8 acres to the LSED

This new contract coupled with the Jefferson Parish contributions and assistance should satisfy continuing operations and proper maintenance of the stadium.

To the best of our knowledge, there is no other minor league team that will receive the financial support from both local and state government.

Just an fyi, please feel free to ask any questions

Unknown

From: BSmith [bsmith@jeffparish.net]
Sent: 12/07/2009 4:34 PM
To: TCapella; JYoung
Cc: MThomas; BGrenrod; SBurke; RBlanchard; ELopez; AGuidry; NLiner
Subject: FW: Item no 30

Attachments: sewerage bid 50-96105 submersible pumps resolution.doc; Bid 50-96105 bid tab.pdf

Re: your question about item no. 30 on Wednesday's agenda, Brett Todd is providing the attached substitute resolution naming the qualified low bidder for this contract.

Please let me know if you need anything further.

Bert Smith
Deputy Chief Administrative Officer
Office of the Parish President
Joseph Yenni Building
Suite 1002
1221 Elmwood Park Blvd.
Jefferson, LA 70123
(504) 736-6412



Our Mission Is:

"Provide the services, leadership, and vision to improve the quality of life in Jefferson Parish."

Monday, December 07, 2009 2:34 PM

To: BSmith
Subject: RE: Item no 30

Attached is the filled in resolution and appropriate bid tabulation sheet if needed.

From: BSmith
Sent: Monday, December 07, 2009 12:09 PM
To: BTodd
Subject: RE: Item no 30

Can you e-mail me the substitute resolution?
I still need you to bring the copies on Wednesday morning.

Bert Smith
Deputy Chief Administrative Officer
Office of the Parish President
Joseph Yenni Building
Suite 1002
1221 Elmwood Park Blvd.
Jefferson, LA 70123
(504) 736-6412



Our Mission Is:

"Provide the services, leadership, and vision to improve the quality of life in Jefferson Parish."

Sent:
Monday,
December
07, 2009

11:18 AM
To: BSmith
Subject: Re: Item no 30

Yes, I have the substitute resolutions ready for distribution. That's the one you wanted me to see you at 930 on Wed. but I can bring to you right now if you want the substitute resolution.

From: BSmith
To: BTodd
Sent: Mon Dec 07 11:15:24 2009
Subject: Item no 30
Brett,
Concern from the Council Chairman: Are we on schedule to have the bids opened and a low bidder to recommend for this (item no. 30)?

Bert Smith
Deputy Chief Administrative Officer
Office of the Parish President
Joseph Yenni Building
Suite 1002
1221 Elmwood Park Blvd.
Jefferson, LA 70123
(504) 736-6412



Our Mission Is:

"Provide the services, leadership, and vision to improve the quality of life in Jefferson Parish."



Jefferson Parish
 200 Derbigny Street
 4th Floor, Suite 4400
 Gretna, LA 70053

LUMP SUM Abstract of Responses for Solicitation #B2009000274							
Click here to attach a post award file to this solicitations header. This file will be viewable by vendors from the abstract solicitation view after award.							
Solicitation Optional Title:		PURCHASE OF A QUANTITY OF SUBMERSIBLE PUMPS					
NIGP Nbr: 7206465		Abbreviated Desc: PURCHASE OF A QUANTITY OF SUBMERSIBLE-PUMPS--0010 - A quantity of Submersible Pumps,-discharge elbow					
Delivery Date	Email Date	Due Date	Solicitation Line Items			Requisition Nbr	
Mon Feb 01 2010 00:00:00	Thu Nov 12 2009 17:07:56	Tue Dec 01 2009 14:00:00	1 TOTAL			R2009001646 Request Tracking Number: 5000096105	
Estimated Price: \$68730							
Line Item View		Federa. Excluded Parties List			Vendor Response Tracking		
Toggle All Switches							
Intent To Award / Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Zero dollars response to item(s): 001							
Intent: <input type="radio"/>	0.00	0		0.00	0.00	Wed Dec 02 2009	09:56:22
Award: <input type="radio"/>						FedID: XX-XXXX408	IP Addr: 70.158.55.2
Manual Abstract: WALK-IN Vendor:	MOTORS & CONTROLS, INC. P00000080821						
Line Item Prices:	001: 0						
Recycle Status:	001: Not applicable						
Vendor Comments:	Item #1 Cmmt: NO BID						
Attached Files:							
Buyer Comments:							
Intent To Award / Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Zero dollars response to item(s): 001							
Intent: <input type="radio"/>						Wed Dec 02	

Award: <input type="checkbox"/>	0.00	0		0.00	0.00	2009	10:09:24
Manual Abstract: WALK-IN Vendor:	ALFRED CONHAGEN INC OF LA P00000089726					FedID: IP Addr:	XX-XXXX892 70.158.55.2
Line Item Prices:	001: 0						
Recycle Status:	001: Not applicable						
Vendor Comments:	Item #1 Cmmt: NO BID						
Attached Files:							
Buyer Comments:							
Intent To Award / Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price <input type="checkbox"/>	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Zero dollars response to Item(s): 001							
Intent: <input type="checkbox"/> Award: <input type="checkbox"/>	0.00	0		0.00	0.00	Wed Dec 02 2009	10:16:45
Manual Abstract: WALK-IN Vendor:	LESLIES SWIMMING POOL SUPPLIES P00000090069					FedID: IP Addr:	XX-XXXX000 70.158.55.2
Line Item Prices:	001: 0						
Recycle Status:	001: Not applicable						
Vendor Comments:	Item #1 Cmmt: NO BID						
Attached Files:							
Buyer Comments:							
Intent To Award / Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price <input type="checkbox"/>	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Intent: <input type="checkbox"/> Award: <input type="checkbox"/>	0.00	0		0.00	0.00	Wed Dec 02 2009	10:01:16
Manual Abstract: WALK-IN Vendor:	ENVIRONMENTAL TECHNICAL SALES, INC. P00000079783					FedID: IP Addr:	XX-XXXX563 70.158.55.2
Line Item Prices:	001: 0.0001						
Recycle Status:	001: Not applicable						
Vendor Comments:	Item #1 Cmmt: No Bid						

Attached Files:							
Buyer Comments:							
Intent To Award / Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Intent: <input type="radio"/> Award: <input type="radio"/>	62730.00	0		62730.00	62730.00	Wed Dec 02 2009	10:26:40
Manual Abstract: WALK-IN Vendor:	PARSON & SANDERSON, INC. PQ0000079530					FedID: IP Addr:	XX-XXXX643 70.158.55.2
Line Item Prices:	001: 20910						
Recycle Status:	001: Not applicable						
Vendor Comments:							
Attached Files:							
Buyer Comments:							
Intent To Award / Award /	Price	Pymt Terms	Pymt Text	Discount Price	LABP Price NLAB: +0	Trans Date	Trans Time
Intent: <input type="radio"/> Award: <input type="radio"/>	65844.99	0		65844.99	65844.99	Wed Dec 02 2009	10:22:55
Manual Abstract: WALK-IN Vendor:	WATERTECH CORPORATION PQ0000090072					FedID: IP Addr:	XX-XXXX000 70.158.55.2
Line Item Prices:	001: 21948.33						
Recycle Status:	001: Not applicable						
Vendor Comments:							
Attached Files:							
Buyer Comments:							

An temporary Excel format document has been written. Click here to access it.

Line Item View

Back

On motion of , seconded by , the following resolution was offered:

RESOLUTION NO.

A resolution accepting the lowest responsible bid of Parson & Sanderson, Inc., under Proposal No. 50-96105, for a quantity of pumps for the Department of Sewerage, at the total cost of \$62,730.00. (Council District 5)

WHEREAS, these pumps will be used to replace pumps at lift station F6-4 located at Cleary Avenue & I-10 South Service Road; and

WHEREAS, these pumps are required to upgrade the existing sewer lift station; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Jefferson Parish Council, of Jefferson Parish, Louisiana, acting as governing authority of said Parish:

SECTION 1. That the lowest responsible bid of Parson & Sanderson, Inc., under Proposal No. 50-96105, for a quantity of pumps, for the Department of Sewerage, at the total cost of \$62,730.00 be and is hereby accepted.

SECTION 2. That the Purchasing Department be and is hereby authorized to issue a purchase order for the purchase of said items, in accordance with the terms of the bid proposal and this resolution.

SECTION 3. That the cost of these items be charged to the Department of Sewerage Capital Budget Account No. 44940-4023-7454(49429.003).

SECTION 4. That the Council Chairman or in his absence, the Vice-Chairman be and is authorized to execute any and all documents necessary to give full force and effect to this resolution.

The foregoing resolution, having been submitted to a vote, the vote thereon was as follows:

YEAS: NAYS: ABSENT:

The resolution was declared to be adopted on this the day of , 2009.

Unknown

From: JYoung [JYoung@jeffparish.net]

Sent: 09/01/2009 10:16 AM

To: TAWhitmer

Subject: Re: Bond Rating

I am interested in going. Let me know. Thx. JFY

-----Original Message-----

From: TIM WHITMER

To: CHRIS ROBERTS

To: ELTON LAGASSE

To: BYRON LEE

To: TOM CAPELLA

To: JOHN YOUNG

To: LOUIS CONGEMI

To: CLeesheng

Cc: GWEN BOLOTTE

Cc: sb_toups@bellsouth.net

Cc: BChaisson

Cc: CRoth

Sent: Aug 31, 2009 4:08 PM

Subject: Bond Rating

We will be making our annual trip to New York to meet with the bonding companies.

The plan is to fly to New York on the afternoon of 12/9 with meetings scheduled for 12/10 and 11th (in the AM) to allow for a return flight on the afternoon of the 11th.

In order that we can finalize arrangements please let me know if you are interested in attending by no later than 430 PM on 9/09/09.

Thanks

Timothy A. Whitmer

Jefferson Parish

Chief Administrative Officer

1221 Elmwood Park Blvd.

Suite 1002

Jefferson, La. 70123

Phone (504) 736-6403

Fax (504) 736-6638

e-mail:timwhitmer@jeffparish.net

03/02/11

